
Personnel Board

2026.01.14 PERSONNEL BOARD AGENDA.PDF

Personnel Board

2026.1.14 PERSONNEL BOARD PACKET_REV 1..PDF

Personnel Board

2026.1.14 PERSONNEL BOARD PACKET.PDF

1. 8:30 A.M.

Documents:

1.I. 8:30 AM

Documents:

1.II. 8:30 AM

Documents:

https://www.southboroughma.gov/e5b80916-57e4-4216-a1d1-793099cb7b54


Town of Southborough, Massachusetts  
Meeting of the Personnel Board 

Wednesday January 14, 2026, 8:30 a.m. 
Remote Meeting 

 
Those wishing to watch or participate remotely can do so by accessing the meeting link at:  

h ttps:/ / ma-south borough .civicplus.com/ 674/ Virtual-Meetin gs 

 
AGENDA 

1. Call to Order 
 

2. Public Comment 
 
3. Administrative Business 

A. Approve minutes from December 22, 2025 
B. Employee Transition Report  

 
4.   Board Discussion/Approval (the Board may vote) 

A. Request for professional development: Christine Russell, Suffolk/MMHR program 
B. FY27 Budget explanation memo  
C. Review/approve amendments to FY27 SAP 

i. Updated recommendations from the Personnel Director 

5.    Other Business (the Board may vote) 
Such other business as may properly come before the Board in accordance with the 
Massachusetts Open Meeting Law, M.G.L. c. 30A, §§18-25. 
 

6.    Board Calendar  
 
7.    Adjournment  
 
Submitted by: Jason Malinowski, Chair 
Revised agenda notations: 

*    Strikethrough indicates a deletion 

**  Bold, italicized items are additions 

https://ma-southborough.civicplus.com/674/Virtual-Meetings
Stephanie Secino
Received



001



002



003



004



005



006



007



008



PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE FY27 SAP 
          
 

VH_12.23.25, 122925 VH MP, 1.7.26 VH 

Section Proposed revision Explanation Date Approved by 
Personnel Board 

Administrative edits  Modify date of Town Meeting approval; renumber 
sections; change board/commission to “appointing 
authority” 

This streamlines the language used in this bylaw  

Definitions Add definition for “transfer”  Added new definition for future use  
Section 3 Combine section 3 and former section 4 

 
• Requires appointing authority approval first to establish/approve a position 

before submitting to the Personnel Board  
• Allows a classification to be established by the Personnel Board during the year 

& ratified at the next town meeting 

 

Section 6 (a) Add “An employee whose compensation is re-set 
due to a change in their job classification or title is 
permitted to receive more than one pay increase in 
a twelve-month period, subject to approval by the 
appointing authority and the Personnel Board 
[when board approval is required].” 

This is happening in practice but was not codified; the bylaw states in Section 6 
that pay may only be adjusted once every 12 months.   

 

Section 7 Delete “Transfers and Promotions” and insert 
“Employee Transitions” 

Modifying the title of this section so it also reflects when someone chooses to apply 
for a position in another functional area [versus a transfer] 

 

 Delete “Personnel Board” and insert “appointing 
authority” 

Allow the appointing authority to make appointments without requiring additional 
approval from the Personnel Board, except when salary authorization is required 

 

 Delete “This is contingent upon the Department 
Head’s recommendation that qualifications and 
performance warrant it” 

This sentence is redundant  

Section 7 (b) Insert “involuntarily” Clarifies the impact of a transfer, making this change when tasks demand it  

Section 8 (a) Delete “will” and insert “may”  Allows flexibility with pre-employment physicals for administrative positions and 
serves as a cost saving measure  

 

Section 8 (b) Probationary period Expands the probationary period an additional 6 months, capping it at a total of 12   
Section 8 (c) Delete “new” Recognizes that the Personnel Director has the ability to set pay rates [up to Step 

8] for an employee who transfers to another department, as well as new staff 
 

Section [prior]10  Delete this section The Finance Director manages the process by which budgets are submitted   

Section 9(b)2 Deletes language referring to the approval process 
for granting three weeks’ vacation per year  

The current vacation accrual schedule now permits three weeks for new hires  

Section 9 (g) 1 Delete “of travel time” Permits the Personnel Director to authorize 2 additional days of bereavement 
leave when appropriate 

 

Section 9 i(1) Add “in the department budget” Stipulates that funding for a one-time degree bonus must come from the 
employee’s department budget 

 

009



PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE FY27 SAP 
          
 

VH_12.23.25, 122925 VH MP, 1.7.26 VH 

 

 

 

 

Section 11(b) Insert “to the Personnel Director” Allows the Personnel Director to authorize part time employees working full time 
hours on a temporary basis; notification will be made to the Personnel Board  

 

Section 11 Delete “approval of” and insert “notification to” Provides notification to the Personnel Board in certain areas without necessitating 
the Board to formally vote  

 

Section 14 Delete “Department Head” and insert “Status” 
• Insert “another department employee” 
• Change “appoint” to “assign” an Acting 

status 

This permits all employees to receive this temporary adjustment when qualified, 
not just department heads 

 

Section 14 (b) Delete “10%” and insert “25%” Grants a 25% increase in weekly pay when an employee is handling the duties of 
another employee who is absent for a period of 3 weeks or more. The current 
version only allows 10%   

 

Section 14 e  Delete “federal election year” and insert “four” Federal elections take place every two years; the salary study is meant to be at 
least quadrennial 

 

Section 14 (e) Delete “The Personnel Board may tentatively add a 
new class to the Classification Schedule or 
reallocate an existing class to a different 
compensation grade, either higher or lower, subject 
to the subsequent ratification of its action by formal 
amendment at the next Annual Town Meeting.” 

This language is already included in Section 3 of this bylaw   

Section 19 Adds an asterisk after “Building Commissioner” This position is now under an employment agreement   
Section 19, Sch A Delete the grid listing grades and steps and insert a 

new grid 
This action delineates a 3% adjustment to the grid over the prior fiscal year  

Section 19, Sch B 
 

Adds the following new stipends to this schedule: 
Certified Accountant       $1,000 
Records Access Officer   $5,000 
Registered Sanitarian      $5,000 

These stipends have been recommended by the pertinent department heads due to 
job functions and certification requirements 

 

010



011



012



013



014



015



016



017



018



019



020



021



022



023



024



025



026



027



028



029



030



From: Katie Barry
To: Vanessa Hale; Jason W. Malinowski
Subject: FW: SAP Updates & Feedback
Date: Friday, January 9, 2026 7:14:33 AM

Hi Vanessa & Jason,
 
Thank you for the continued opportunity to provide input on SAP-related matters. I genuinely
appreciate the openness to ongoing feedback and dialogue, and I am offering the comments below in
that same spirit of collaboration and transparency. I want to emphasize that the items noted are
intended as suggestions and considerations, rather than comments on finalized rules or outcomes.
 
Many of the proposed changes have the potential to directly affect employees' day-to-day
responsibilities, compensation, and overall morale, so the process by which they are reviewed,
discussed, and clarified is especially important.
 
It would be extremely helpful if packets and supporting materials could be distributed earlier to
allow adequate time for review and meaningful discussion. With short notice, it can be challenging
to fully digest the information and understand the broader implications of agenda items. Continued
collaboration with SAP members on decisions that directly impact employees' livelihoods and daily
responsibilities is also critical. Regular working discussions or feedback opportunities with SAP
involvement would help build trust and support well-informed decision-making. As the SAP meets
monthly, department heads and members of the Personnel Board are always welcome to attend, and I
am happy to include you on invitations if you would like to join discussions around future agenda
items, ideas, or feedback.
 
Section 3: New or Changed Position
The ability to tentatively add a class or regrade a position-particularly when lowering a position's
grade-prior to the next TM raises some concern. It is not entirely clear what issue this proposed
change is intended to address, and that lack of clarity can create uncertainty for employees. While
updates and adjustments are often necessary as needs evolve, I worry that well-intended language
under the current Board could be interpreted differently in the future. Any clarification around the
purpose and safeguards of this change would be helpful and, if possible, included directly in the
SAP.
 
Section 5 (New): Compensation
The exclusion of sick and holiday time from hours worked is troubling. In particular, forced
overtime should be exempt, as employees have no control over holidays or illness. When employees
are required to work during weeks that include a holiday or sick time, they are not given a choice,
which can create a perception of unfairness. While these provisions may be outlined by law, there
appears to be an opportunity to take a more generous and employee-supportive approach.
 
Section 6a (New): Salary Adjustment & Compensation Policies
Removing the language that allows SAP employees to appear before the Board prior to rate or grade
change decisions could have unintended negative consequences. As written, this change is not
clearly addressed elsewhere and could reasonably be interpreted as limiting employees' ability to
advocate for themselves until after a decision has already been made. Referring to the alternate
process as an "appeal" may also carry a negative connotation and could disadvantage employees who
lack strong managerial advocacy. I respectfully suggest keeping the existing language to ensure
employees clearly understand they are welcome to appear before the Board ahead of such impactful
decisions.
 
Section 14 (New): Appointment of "Acting" Status

mailto:kbarry@southboroughma.gov
mailto:vhale@southboroughma.gov
mailto:jmalinowski@southboroughma.gov


Eliminating the ability to earn overtime while covering an additional position is discouraging.
Overtime is often necessary when employees take on added responsibilities while continuing to
perform their primary role. While the increased percentage pay is very much appreciated, removing
the overtime option may risk reduced service levels, lower morale, and a perception that extra efforts
are undervalued. Allowing overtime at the employee's original base rate while acting in more than
one role could be a fair compromise and a meaningful acknowledgment of the additional workload.
 
I respectfully ask that these sections be revisited with direct SAP input before any final decisions are
made. Continued collaboration-through working sessions, feedback periods, or joint discussions-will
help ensure these policies are clear, fair, and supportive of both operational needs and employee
well-being.
 
Thank you again for the opportunity to consistently provide input and to be part of these
conversations. I truly appreciate your time and your willingness to engage in ongoing dialogue.
 
Katie
 
Katie Barry
Business Administrator
Town of Southborough
Building Department
9 Cordaville Road, Lower Level
Southborough, M.A. 01772
508-485-0717
kbarry@southboroughma.gov
 

mailto:kbarry@southboroughma.gov


TOWN OF SOUTHBOROUGH 

 
FACILITIES DEPARTMENT 

TOWN HOUSE ∙ 17 COMMON STREET ∙ SOUTHBOROUGH, MASSACHUSETTS 01772-1662 
(508) 485-8175 ∙ FAX (508) 485-7189 ∙ jparent@southboroughma.com 

 

Mr. Jason Malinowski, Chair 

Personnel Board 

Town of Southborough 

17 Common Street 

Southborough, MA 01772 

 

January 12, 2026 

 

Dear Chairman Malinowski, 

 

I am writing regarding a proposed change to the wording of the current SAP document, which is 

scheduled to be discussed at your upcoming January 14, 2026, meeting. I would like to request 

that your board consider amending the wording of Section 6b-Compensation in the current SAP 

to include vacation time, sick time, personal time, and especially holiday time in the calculation of 

the 40-hour threshold that must be met before overtime is paid. Given that Maintenance 

Technicians in the Facilities Department must often come in for snow removal and surface 

treatment before or after hours and on weekends throughout the winter months, which often have 

holidays in them, they frequently only receive straight time for these labor intense off-hours tasks. 

Once I even had to have one of the department’s technicians come in to address an issue on 

Christmas Day, and they only received straight time for this call-in. I believe amending the SAP 

to include paid time off in the calculation of the 40-hour overtime threshold would improve the 

morale of the Facilities Department’s Maintenance Technicians who are often negatively impacted 

financially by the unfortunate timing of issues, such as snowstorms that occur during a holiday 

week. Given the above reasoning, coupled with the fact that I believe this change would have a 

minimal impact on the budget (I anticipate less than $1,000 annually), I would greatly appreciate 

your board’s support regarding this request.   

 

Thank you, 

TOWN OF SOUTHBOROUGH 

FACILITIES DEPARTMENT 

 

 

John A. Parent, MBA 

Director of Facilities 

Energy Manager 

mailto:jparent@southboroughma.com


001



002



003



004



005



006



007



008



PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE FY27 SAP 
          
 

VH_12.23.25, 122925 VH MP, 1.7.26 VH 

Section Proposed revision Explanation Date Approved by 
Personnel Board 

Administrative edits  Modify date of Town Meeting approval; renumber 
sections; change board/commission to “appointing 
authority” 

This streamlines the language used in this bylaw  

Definitions Add definition for “transfer”  Added new definition for future use  
Section 3 Combine section 3 and former section 4 

 
• Requires appointing authority approval first to establish/approve a position 

before submitting to the Personnel Board  
• Allows a classification to be established by the Personnel Board during the year 

& ratified at the next town meeting 

 

Section 6 (a) Add “An employee whose compensation is re-set 
due to a change in their job classification or title is 
permitted to receive more than one pay increase in 
a twelve-month period, subject to approval by the 
appointing authority and the Personnel Board 
[when board approval is required].” 

This is happening in practice but was not codified; the bylaw states in Section 6 
that pay may only be adjusted once every 12 months.   

 

Section 7 Delete “Transfers and Promotions” and insert 
“Employee Transitions” 

Modifying the title of this section so it also reflects when someone chooses to apply 
for a position in another functional area [versus a transfer] 

 

 Delete “Personnel Board” and insert “appointing 
authority” 

Allow the appointing authority to make appointments without requiring additional 
approval from the Personnel Board, except when salary authorization is required 

 

 Delete “This is contingent upon the Department 
Head’s recommendation that qualifications and 
performance warrant it” 

This sentence is redundant  

Section 7 (b) Insert “involuntarily” Clarifies the impact of a transfer, making this change when tasks demand it  

Section 8 (a) Delete “will” and insert “may”  Allows flexibility with pre-employment physicals for administrative positions and 
serves as a cost saving measure  

 

Section 8 (b) Probationary period Expands the probationary period an additional 6 months, capping it at a total of 12   
Section 8 (c) Delete “new” Recognizes that the Personnel Director has the ability to set pay rates [up to Step 

8] for an employee who transfers to another department, as well as new staff 
 

Section [prior]10  Delete this section The Finance Director manages the process by which budgets are submitted   

Section 9(b)2 Deletes language referring to the approval process 
for granting three weeks’ vacation per year  

The current vacation accrual schedule now permits three weeks for new hires  

Section 9 (g) 1 Delete “of travel time” Permits the Personnel Director to authorize 2 additional days of bereavement 
leave when appropriate 

 

Section 9 i(1) Add “in the department budget” Stipulates that funding for a one-time degree bonus must come from the 
employee’s department budget 

 

009



PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE FY27 SAP 
          
 

VH_12.23.25, 122925 VH MP, 1.7.26 VH 

 

 

 

 

Section 11(b) Insert “to the Personnel Director” Allows the Personnel Director to authorize part time employees working full time 
hours on a temporary basis; notification will be made to the Personnel Board  

 

Section 11 Delete “approval of” and insert “notification to” Provides notification to the Personnel Board in certain areas without necessitating 
the Board to formally vote  

 

Section 14 Delete “Department Head” and insert “Status” 
• Insert “another department employee” 
• Change “appoint” to “assign” an Acting 

status 

This permits all employees to receive this temporary adjustment when qualified, 
not just department heads 

 

Section 14 (b) Delete “10%” and insert “25%” Grants a 25% increase in weekly pay when an employee is handling the duties of 
another employee who is absent for a period of 3 weeks or more. The current 
version only allows 10%   

 

Section 14 e  Delete “federal election year” and insert “four” Federal elections take place every two years; the salary study is meant to be at 
least quadrennial 

 

Section 14 (e) Delete “The Personnel Board may tentatively add a 
new class to the Classification Schedule or 
reallocate an existing class to a different 
compensation grade, either higher or lower, subject 
to the subsequent ratification of its action by formal 
amendment at the next Annual Town Meeting.” 

This language is already included in Section 3 of this bylaw   

Section 19 Adds an asterisk after “Building Commissioner” This position is now under an employment agreement   
Section 19, Sch A Delete the grid listing grades and steps and insert a 

new grid 
This action delineates a 3% adjustment to the grid over the prior fiscal year  

Section 19, Sch B 
 

Adds the following new stipends to this schedule: 
Certified Accountant       $1,000 
Records Access Officer   $5,000 
Registered Sanitarian      $5,000 

These stipends have been recommended by the pertinent department heads due to 
job functions and certification requirements 

 

010



011



012



013



014



015



016



017



018



019



020



021



022



023



024



025



026



027



028



029



030




